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EDITORIAL

	 The context of the current is filled to the brim with information that is exchanged in seconds and 
consumed immediately. The fast-paced nature leaves little room for processing and deep delving into 
topics and ideas that need the research to enlighten people with its profound truths. The task that is left 
to this Journal and its editorial team has been to facilitate between these eager researchers who have 
done their due diligence of deep researching and to provide a trusted platform to highlight these essential 
findings that they have toiled and worked towards. 

	 The 11th Edition of this multidisciplinary journal has remained true to its task of providing a 
plethora of research articles that come from different, contrasting fields of science, humanities, social 
sciences, anthropology; creating a web of connections that pursue findings with deep insight for the 
readers. The flood of information has not just been presented and unchecked but rather given the full 
effort of being reviewed and edited painstakingly, in contrast to the contemporary current of providing 
ignorant misinformation. The task has been to assure the quality of time and labour for the justice of the 
researchers as well as the readers. 

	 As one peruses through the pages of this journal, the melting pot of the multidisciplinary aspect 
will clearly stand out in the spine of its contents. Cultural perspectives from the Naga contexts of 
various tribes as seen in the works of researchers are showcased; writers who have gone into deep 
excavations of folklore, government setups and the richness of the different heritages. Scientific delving 
into vaccinations with thorough data have been highlighted with visual representations of their findings. 
Even in the context of humanities, research writers have provided their findings of cross connections 
between traditional folklore, novel pieces and the environment, providing unique nuances. Philosophical 
piques of intrigue into its approach towards religion, healthcare that come from traditional contexts, and 
so many more perspectives have been given a space under the watchful eye of the journal for its readers. 

	 Academia can be an ever-growing world of conferences, paper presentations and engaging with 
like-minded individuals that have the same thirst for knowledge sharing. The “Fazl Ali College Journal” 
has thus done its duty or bridging this demand and supply with quality checks marking every step of the 
way. We thank all the contributors who have made this a successful edition.
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